
ELMIRA WATER BOARD

COMPANY
Forms

Yes/No
HYDROFLUOSILICIC 

ACID "HFS" PER GAL.
LIQUID CHLORINE 1 TON 

CYLINDER

POLYHYDROXO-
SULFATOALUMINUM 

CHLORIDE "PAC" PER 
GALLON

ORTHOPHOSPHATE 
PER GAL.

SODIUM 
HYDROXIDE 

(Caustic Soda)
PER GAL.

SODIUM 
HYPOCHLORITE 

15 gal Carboys 

SODIUM 
PERMANGANATE /

per gal - 330 gal 
Carboys 

Applied Specialties, Inc. remain on list

Amrex Chemical Co. yes no bid no bid no bid no bid 0.8200 1.25 gal/18.75 no bid

Bison Laboratories, Inc. yes no bid no bid no bid no bid 1.3380 2.85 gal/42.75 no bid

Carus Phosphates, Inc.(formerly Calciquest) yes no bid no bid no bid 3.7950 no bid no bid no  bid

Delta Chemical Corporation yes no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

ESC Environmental

F2 Industries, LLC 

Holland Company yes no bid no bid 1.7000 no bid no bid no bid no bid

JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc. yes no bid 561.00 no bid no bid 0.7000 62.50 no bid

Kemira Water Solutions Inc./formerly Kemiron, 
Eaglebrook, & Sternson yes no bid no bid 1.9650 no bid no bid no bid no bid

Main Pool & Chemical, Inc.

Kramer Chemicals, Inc.

Sal Chemical Company no no bid no bid no bid 6.1550 no bid no bid no bid

Shannon Chemical Corp. yes no bid no bid no bid 5.1400 no bid no bid no bid

Slack Chemical Company yes 5.8900 729.00 no bid no bid 1.2400 18.14 7.989

Solvay Fluorides, Inc/formally Chemtech 
Products, Inc.

remain on list for 
HFS

Thatcher Company of New York
bid returned; 
arrived late

2009 Results
Shannon Chemical 8.3200
Holland Company 1.8000
JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc. 541.00 1.7700
Slack Chemical Company 5.49
Amrex Chemical Company 21.0000
new item not bid
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